BRAZORIA COUNTY TABULATION

ITB # 25-38 High Density Polyethyene Pipe and Hi:

h Performance Pipe

OPEN DATE: RESPONDENT'S NAME O'Day Rental & Supply Inc.
FRIDAY, MARCH 28, 2025 @ 11am ADDRESS 6614 Broadway St.
LOCATION: Pearland, TX 77581
PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM QUOTED BY: Suzanne Elliott
237 E. LOCUST ST. SUITE 406 ANGLETON TELEPHONE NUMBER: 281-485-6111
ANGLETON, TX 77515 FAX NUMBER:

ATTACHMENT A - BID TABLE
Description Unit of Measure Unit Price
18" HDPE PIPE LF $13.47
18" T FITTING (HDPE) EA 667.22
18" GRATE (HDPE) EA 280.53
18" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA 103.58
24" HDPE PIPE LF $23.25
24" T FITTING (HDPE) EA $1,366.29
24" GRATE (HDPE) EA $487.51
24" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $125.80
30" HDPE PIPE LF $34.55
30" T FITTING (HDPE) EA $1,897.38
30" GRATE (HDPE) EA No Bid
30" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $148.43
36" HDPE PIPE LF $44.63
36" T FITTING (HDPE) EA $2,467.60
36" GRATE (HDPE) EA No Bid
36" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $173.66
42" HDPE PIPE LF $55.35
42" T FITTING (HDPE) EA $3,680.90
42" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $193.39
48" HDPE PIPE LF $71.77
48" T FITTING (HDPE) EA $3,972.22
48" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $214.03
60" HDPE PIPE LF $106.17
60" T FITTING (HDPE) EA $5,391.58
60" HDPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $333.89
18" HPPE PIPE LF $18.86
18" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $839.02
18" GRATE (HPPE) EA 280.53
18" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA 194.83
24" HPPE PIPE LF $29.00
24" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $1,610.57
24" GRATE (HPPE) EA $487.51
24" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $228.16
30" HPPE PIPE LF $45.49
30" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $1,665.69
30" GRATE (HPPE) EA No Bid
30" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $283.15
36" HPPE PIPE LF $57.95
36" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $2,225.79
36" GRATE (HPPE) EA No Bid
36" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $325.28
42" HPPE PIPE LF $69.25
42" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $3,680.90
42" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $387.62
48" HPPE PIPE LF $93.77
48" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $3,972.22
48" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $444.83
60" HPPE PIPE LF $129.87
60" T FITTING (HPPE) EA $5,391.58
60" HPPE ADAPTER TO RCP EA $559.74

Delivery can be made in days after receipt of order

[7-10 working days
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