
10126 CASH ROAD 4635 CR 418 545 WILSON RD
STAFFORD, TX 77477-4409 HOUSTON, TX 77583 FREEPORT, TX 77541

281-969-1691 713-800-2157 979-233-3366
BRIAN ASP MARVIN HERNANDEZ MIKE DAMIAN

basp@durwoodgreene.com MARVIN.HERNANDEZ@ARCOSA.COM mike@vernor.com

STABILIZING MATERIALS COUNTY ID #

5.1 LIME NO BID NO BID  NO BID
5.1.1 Hydrated Lime NO BID NO BID  NO BID

5.1.2 Lime Slurry 6750 NO BID NO BID  NO BID

5.2.1  6% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 6752 - $20.45 $19.50

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 6752 - $20.45 $19.50
Hauling First Mile 7104 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 7105 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons

5.2.1 7% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 9758 - - $21.25

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 9758 - - $21.25
Hauling First Mile 9759 - - $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 9760 - - $0.35

14 Tons
5.2.2   8% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 6753 - $23.10 $22.85

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 6753 - $23.10 $22.85
Hauling First Mile 7106 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 7107 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons
5.2.3.  12% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 6754 - $30.45 $28.25

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 6754 - $30.45 $28.25
Hauling First Mile 7108 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 7109 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons

5.3.1  3-1/2% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE  PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 6757 - $53.53 $65.00

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 6757 - $53.53 $65.00
Hauling First Mile 7114 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 7115 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons
5.3.2   6% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 6758 - $56.71 $70.00

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 6758 - $56.71 $70.00

Hauling First Mile 7116 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 7117 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons

5.4.1 6% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 6760 - $48.20 $39.25

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 6760 - $48.20 $39.25
Hauling First Mile 7120 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 7121 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons

ITB#21-33 ROAD MATERIALS - STABILIZING MATERIALS

5.4 CEMENT STABILIZED RECLAIMED BASE-CRUSHED CONCRETE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated reclaimed base material, cement, and water, mixed at a central mixing plant.

 State Minimum truckload if required

 State Minimum truckload if required

 State Minimum truckload if required

Contact Name

RENEWAL TERM: 
APRIL 26, 2025 - APRIL 25, 2026

Phone
City, State, Zip

Address

5.2 CEMENT STABILIZED SAND 
*Shall consist of sand, free of foreign matter and having a plasticity index not exceeding 10, stabilized with cement in proportions bid as follows:

5.3  CEMENT STABILIZED BASE-LIMESTONE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated base material, composed of new crushed limestone, cement, and water, mixed at a central mixing plant.

 State Minimum truckload if required

 State Minimum truckload if required

 State Minimum truckload if required

 State Minimum truckload if required

Email Address

VERNOR MATERIAL & 
EQUIPMENTCHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETEAMERICAN MATERIALS

mailto:basp@durwoodgreene.com
mailto:MARVIN.HERNANDEZ@ARCOSA.COM
mailto:mike@vernor.com


ITB#21-33 ROAD MATERIALS - STABILIZING MATERIALS

RENEWAL TERM: 
APRIL 26, 2025 - APRIL 25, 2026

Add

VERNOR MATERIAL & 
EQUIPMENTCHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETEAMERICAN MATERIALS

5.4.2  12% cement by weight Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 9205 - $55.10 $45.50

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 9205 - $55.10 $45.50
Hauling First Mile 9206 - $3.35 $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 9207 - $0.50 $0.35

- 15 Tons 14 Tons

Price per TON Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 6765 - - $314.00

Hauling First Mile 8199 - - $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 8200 - - $0.35
Price per ton for Spreader Bar 6766 - - $10.00

- - 24 Tons
Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto County 
trucks 9727 - - 314.00

PRICE PER TON INCREASE Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant loaded onto County 
Trucks 6779 $80.00 - -

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 6779 $80.00 - -

Hauling First Mile 7084 $4.25 - -

Hauling Each Additional Mile 7085 $0.25 - -

14 Tons - -

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 9728 PRICE UPON REQUEST -

Price per TON Price per TON PRICE PER TON INCREASE 

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 6767 - - $159.00
Hauling First Mile 8201 - - $3.50
Hauling Each Additional Mile 8202 - - $0.35
Price per ton for Spreader Bar 6768 - - $10.00

PLANT LOCATION
500 WARDSTREET

ANGLETON
MILEAGE MILEAGE

6 26 14
23 14 40
3 25 15

23 19 28
10 33 1
14 40 25
24 5 38
3 24 14

22 46 11
23 14 36
30 56 20
14 32 25 7117
16 37 24

5.6  LIME-FLY ASH PLANT MIX - NO BID RECIEVED

5.8 ASPHALT STABILIZED BASE -BLACK BASE
Per TxDOT Item 292.4(A), Grade 1

5.9 RECLAIMED CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS (ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of reclaimed portland cement, Class A or Class H, containing no toxic or hazardous components other than crystalline silica, delivered in tanker-type trucks to jobsite anywher

 State minimum truckload if required

 State minimum truckload if required

5.7 CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS (ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of portland cement, Type I, IP, or II in accordance with TxDOT Item 524.2., delivered in tanker-type trucks to jobsite anywhere in Brazoria County.  Price bid shall include distributor 

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.5 FLY ASH - NO BID RECEIVED


	Contract Sheet

