

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Aluminum Sign Blanks

BIDDERS NAME ADDRESS CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE NO. FAX NUMBER EMAIL			VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS			TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.			LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC			NEWMAN SIGNS INC.		
			408 EAST BERRY AVENUE			3310 FRICK RD			22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST.			1606 6TH AVE S W		
			FOLEY, AL 36536			HOUSTON, TX 77086			FRANKFORT, OH 45628			JAMESTOWN, ND 58401		
			DAVID BEVIACQUA			CHRISTINA JOHNSON			SAMANTHA WILSON			DANI PAUL		
			800-633-6845			281-448-7711			740-998-5363			800-437-9770		
			VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM			SALES@OSBURNS.COM			samantha@lightleenterprises.com			dpaul@newmansigns.com		
DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN			PRICE EA. BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN		
	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +	1 to 25	26 to 100	100 +
6" X 24"	801-09	7209	\$2.51	\$2.51	\$2.46	\$7.25	\$6.95	\$6.75	\$3.65	\$3.55	\$3.45	\$4.93	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 24" Green (both sides) no white border	801-09	9385	\$11.61	\$11.61	\$11.38	\$24.00	\$23.50	\$23.00	\$9.95	\$9.85	\$9.75	\$14.95	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 24" Brown (both sides)	801-09	9386	\$11.61	\$11.61	\$11.38	\$9.00	\$8.85	\$8.65	\$9.95	\$9.85	\$9.75	\$9.17	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 30"	801-09	7210	\$3.24	\$3.24	\$3.18	\$14.00	\$13.75	\$13.50	\$4.56	\$4.44	\$4.31	\$5.67	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 30" Green (both sides) no white border	801-09	9387	\$14.59	\$14.59	\$14.30	\$29.50	\$29.00	\$28.75	\$12.44	\$12.31	\$12.19	\$17.16	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 30" Brown (both sides)	801-09	9388	\$14.59	\$14.59	\$14.30	\$31.00	\$30.50	\$30.25	\$12.44	\$12.31	\$12.19	\$9.93	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 36"	801-09	7211	\$3.83	\$3.83	\$3.75	\$12.00	\$11.75	\$11.50	\$5.48	\$5.33	\$5.18	\$6.42	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 36" Green (both sides) no white border	801-09	9389	\$17.30	\$17.30	\$16.95	\$36.50	\$36.00	\$35.75	\$14.93	\$14.78	\$14.63	\$19.37	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 36" Brown (both sides)	801-09	9390	\$17.30	\$17.30	\$16.95	\$38.50	\$38.00	\$37.75	\$14.93	\$14.78	\$14.63	\$19.37	No Bid	No Bid
9" X 12"	801-09	7573	\$3.18	\$3.18	\$3.12	\$7.95	\$7.80	\$7.70	\$2.90	\$2.80	\$2.82	\$4.19	No Bid	No Bid
12" x 18"	801-09	837	\$3.83	\$3.83	\$3.75	\$13.00	\$12.50	\$12.25	\$5.48	\$5.33	\$5.18	\$6.42	No Bid	No Bid
18" x 18"	801-09	838	\$5.73	\$5.73	\$5.61	\$19.50	\$19.00	\$18.75	\$8.21	\$7.99	\$7.76	\$8.64	No Bid	No Bid
18" x 24"	801-09	839	\$7.52	\$7.52	\$7.37	\$27.00	\$26.50	\$26.25	\$10.95	\$10.65	\$10.35	\$10.87	No Bid	No Bid
24" x 24"	801-09	841	\$10.02	\$10.02	\$9.82	\$35.00	\$34.50	\$34.25	\$14.60	\$14.20	\$13.80	\$13.84	No Bid	No Bid
24" x 30"	801-09	1654	\$12.91	\$12.91	\$12.65	\$42.00	\$41.50	\$41.25	\$18.25	\$17.75	\$17.25	\$16.80	No Bid	No Bid
24" x 36"	801-09	2191	\$15.59	\$15.59	\$15.28	\$50.00	\$49.50	\$49.50	\$21.90	\$21.30	\$20.70	\$19.78	No Bid	No Bid
30" x 30" (Diamond Shape)	801-09	843	\$16.13	\$16.13	\$15.81	\$52.00	\$51.50	\$51.25	\$22.81	\$22.19	\$21.56	\$20.51	No Bid	No Bid
36" x 36" (Diamond Shape)	801-09	847	\$22.96	\$22.96	\$22.50	\$75.00	\$74.00	\$73.00	\$32.85	\$31.95	\$31.05	\$28.67	No Bid	No Bid
Days to deliver			30-45			21-30 DAYS			30-45			11-21		

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade

BIDDERS NAME		VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC				NEWMAN SIGNS INC.			
ADDRESS		408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536				3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086				22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628				1606 6TH AVE S W JAMESTOWN, ND 58401			
CONTACT PERSON		DAVID BEVIACQUA				CHRISTINA JOHNSON				SAMANTHA WILSON				DANI PAUL			
TELEPHONE NO.		800-633-6845				281-448-7711				740-998-5363				800-437-9770			
FAX NUMBER																	
EMAIL		VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				SALES@OSBURNS.COM				samantha@lightleenterprises.com				dpaul@newmansigns.com			
2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN	
SIZE / DESCRIPTION	TX DOT #	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+
12X36 Bridge Marker R	OM-3R	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$43.00	\$41.00	\$55.00	\$53.00	\$22.92	\$21.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12 X 36 Bridge Marker L	OM-3L	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$43.00	\$41.00	\$55.00	\$53.00	\$22.92	\$21.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18 X 18 Advisory Speed Plate (Blank)	W13-1P	\$15.85	\$15.53	\$15.85	\$15.53	\$32.00	\$31.00	\$41.00	\$39.00	\$17.19	\$16.29	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18 X 18 Brazoria County Road Number Green / White		\$15.85	\$15.53	\$15.85	\$15.53	\$32.00	\$31.00	\$41.00	\$39.00	\$17.19	\$16.29	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 18 County Maintenance Begins		\$19.35	\$18.96	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$43.00	\$41.00	\$55.00	\$53.00	\$22.92	\$21.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 18 County Maintenance Ends		\$19.35	\$18.96	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$43.00	\$41.00	\$55.00	\$53.00	\$22.92	\$21.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 18 Cell Phone Use Prohibited	S7-1T	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$19.35	\$18.96	\$43.00	\$41.00	\$55.00	\$53.00	\$22.92	\$21.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 Speed Limit (Blank) MPH	R2-1	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 Speed Limit (with Numbers) MPH	R2-1-XX	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 No Parking	R8-3a	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 Weight Limit (Blank) Tons	R12-1	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 Weight Limit (with Numbers) Tons	W12-1	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 No Dumping Allowed	R19-5T	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 Do Not Pass	R4-1	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 Chevron Alignment	W1-8R	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 30 No Thru Trucks	R10-9A	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 36 Weight Limit - Axle or Tandem (Blank) LBS	R12-4 or R12-5	\$38.70	\$37.93	\$38.70	\$37.93	\$85.00	\$82.00	\$110.00	\$106.00	\$45.84	\$43.44	No Bid	No Bid	\$41.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24 X 36 Weight Limit - Tandem Axle (Blank) LBS	R12-4 or R12-5	\$38.70	\$37.93	\$38.70	\$37.93	\$85.00	\$82.00	\$110.00	\$106.00	\$45.84	\$43.44	No Bid	No Bid	\$41.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 STOP	R1-1	\$38.90	\$38.12	\$38.90	\$38.12	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.25	\$44.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30" Hinged Sign Yellow with Black Message - Water Over Road / Drive Friendly		\$121.08	\$118.66	\$121.08	\$118.66	\$118.00	\$114.00	\$150.00	\$145.00	\$58.50	\$56.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 24 Detour (Florescent Orange)	M4-9R or M4-9L	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$32.25	\$31.61	\$71.00	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$88.00	\$38.20	\$36.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$41.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Right - Left Turn	W-1-1R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Right - Left Curve (Yellow)	W1-2R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Turn (Yellow)	W1-3R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Right - Left Reverse Curve (Yellow)	W1-4R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Right - Left Winding Road (Yellow)	W1-5R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Cross Road	W2-1	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN	
SIZE / DESCRIPTION	TX DOT #	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+
30 X 30 Side Road	W2-2R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 T Symbol	W2-4	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Y Symbol	W2-5	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Bump	W8-1	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Dip	W8-2	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 No Shoulder	W8-23	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$43.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Narrow Bridge	W5-2	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Pavement Ends	W8-3	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Dead End	W14-1	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Cattle Guard	W17-4T	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$43.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Fresh Oil 5 MPH (Florescent Orange)	CW21-2	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 High Water		\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Railroad Advance Warning (for parallel roads)	W10-3R(L)	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Stop Ahead (SYMBOL ONLY)	W3-1	\$40.53	\$39.72	\$40.53	\$39.72	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$52.00	\$49.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$45.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Yield Ahead (Symbol Only)	W3-2	\$39.19	\$38.41	\$39.19	\$38.41	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$52.00	\$49.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 No Outlet	W14-2	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$88.00	\$85.00	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30 X 30 Water Over Road (yellow background / black border) Diamond Grade		\$40.31	\$39.50	\$40.31	\$39.50	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$147.00	\$142.00	\$47.75	\$45.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 STOP	R1-1	\$56.71	\$55.58	\$56.71	\$55.58	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$68.40	\$65.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$59.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 YIELD (measures 30" wide)	R1-2	\$28.55	\$27.98	\$28.55	\$27.98	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$35.50	\$34.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$37.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 Railroad Advance Warning	W10-1	\$56.82	\$55.68	\$56.82	\$55.68	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$68.76	\$65.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 School Crossing Sign	S4-3P	\$19.34	\$18.95	\$19.34	\$18.95	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$68.76	\$65.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 x 36 Load Zoned Bridge	W12-5T	\$58.05	\$56.89	\$58.05	\$56.89	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$68.76	\$65.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$77.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 x 36 Road Work Ahead (Florescent Orange)	CW20-10	\$58.05	\$56.89	\$58.05	\$56.89	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$68.76	\$65.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36 x 36 Workers Ahead (Florescent Orange) SYMBOL ONLY	CW21-1aT	\$58.05	\$56.89	\$58.05	\$56.89	\$128.00	\$124.00	\$165.00	\$160.00	\$68.76	\$65.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$91.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48 x 24 Large Arrow	W1-6R(L)	\$51.60	\$50.57	\$51.60	\$50.57	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$147.00	\$142.00	\$61.12	\$57.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.87	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48 X 24 Double Headed Arrow	W1-7	\$51.60	\$50.57	\$51.60	\$50.57	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$147.00	\$142.00	\$61.12	\$57.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.87	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48 X 24 School Zone (Speed and Time Blank)	SS-1	\$57.24	\$56.10	\$57.24	\$56.10	\$114.00	\$110.00	\$147.00	\$142.00	\$61.12	\$57.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$59.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48 x 30 Road Closed	R11-2	\$64.50	\$63.21	\$64.50	\$63.21	\$142.00	\$137.00	\$180.00	\$174.00	\$76.40	\$72.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$64.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN		3M BRAND PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN		EQUIVALENT DIAMOND GRADE PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED IN	
SIZE / DESCRIPTION	TX DOT #	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+	1-50	50+
48 X 30 Road Work Ahead (Florescent Orange)	CW20-1D	\$64.50	\$63.21	\$64.50	\$63.21	\$142.00	\$137.00	\$180.00	\$174.00	\$76.40	\$72.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$100.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Days to deliver ARO		30-45				7-14				30-45		No Bid	No Bid	11-21		No Bid	No Bid

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Custom Fabricated Sign

BIDDERS NAME	VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS	LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC	NEWMAN SIGNS INC.
ADDRESS	408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536	22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628	1606 6TH AVE S W JAMESTOWN, ND 58401
CONTACT PERSON	DAVID BEVIACQUA	SAMANTHA WILSON	DANI PAUL
TELEPHONE NO.	800-633-6845	740-998-5363	800-437-9770
FAX NUMBER			
EMAIL	VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM	samantha@lightleenterprises.com	dpaul@newmansigns.com
DESCRIPTION: 3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER EACH
DUNES ARE PROTECTED KEEP OUT NO GLASS CONTAINERS ALLOWED ON BEACH UP TO \$500 FINE	\$31.10	\$86.50	\$32.49
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:	30-45	30-45	

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Delineators

BIDDERS NAME	TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC			
ADDRESS	3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086				22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628			
CONTACT PERSON	CHRISTINA JOHNSON				SAMANTHA WILSON			
TELEPHONE NO.	281-448-7711				740-998-5363			
FAX NUMBER								
EMAIL	SALES@OSBURNS.COM				samantha@lightleenterprises.com			
DESCRIPTION - COMM CODE: 550-41	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-50	51+
2 PART POXY FOR SURFACE MOUNT SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) GALLON EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON CATALYST	Picco	B22	\$116.50	\$112.50	Apex Traffic Supply	1 Gal Epoxy Kit	\$140.00	\$135.00
CARSONITE POST, FLAT , DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"	Carsonite	RCM306201	\$28.50	\$27.50	Carsonite	CRM	\$21.40	\$20.70
CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE , DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62"	Carsonite	CRM406201	\$32.50	\$31.50	Carsonite	Survivor	\$32.40	\$31.85
STUB, ANCHOR FOR CONCAVE POST	Carsonite	ARCBAR	\$3.10	\$2.95	Carsonite	Survivor Anchor	\$8.95	\$8.80
CARSONITE POST DRIVER	\$350.00				\$328.80			
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:	21-30 days ARO				30-45			

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Pavement Marker

BIDDERS NAME	TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				ROADSAFE TRAFFIC LLC			
ADDRESS	3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086				601 COMMERCIAL DR. BUDA, TX 78610			
CONTACT PERSON	CHRISTINA JOHNSON				VALERA BYRD			
TELEPHONE NO.	281-448-7711				512-437-6499			
FAX NUMBER								
EMAIL	SALES@OSBURNS.COM				vbyrd@roadsafetraffic.com			
6.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS COMM CODE:550-30	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG
TYPE I-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE, WHITE)	Ennis		EA	\$1.15	3M		ea	\$1.35
TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH AMBER)	Ennis		EA	\$1.15	3M		ea	\$1.40
TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED TRAILING)	Ennis		EA	\$1.15	3M		ea	\$1.75
TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE FACES; BOTH WHITE)	Ennis		EA	\$1.15	3M		ea	\$1.40
TYPE II-BLUE	Ennis		EA	\$1.55	3M		ea	\$1.75
EXPOXY (TUBE TYPE)FOR RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER	\$34.50				\$28.00			
EXPOXY GUN	\$112.50				\$28.00			
SELF ADHESIVE - TYPE 1-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE, WHITE)	3M		EA	\$3.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
(TWO REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH AMBER)	3M		EA	\$3.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
(TWO REFLECTIVE FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED	3M		EA	\$3.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
(TWO REFLECTIVE FACES; BOTH WHITE)	3M		EA	\$3.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

6.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS COMM CODE:550-30	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG
TYPE I-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE, WHITE)	Ennis		EA	\$1.15	3M		ea	\$1.35
SELF ADHESIVE - TYPE II-BLUE	3M		EA	\$4.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:	30				10-14			

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Roll Up Construction Signs & Posts

BIDDERS NAME		VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC				ROADSAFE TRAFFIC LLC			
ADDRESS		408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536				3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086				22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628				601 COMMERCIAL DR. BUDA, TX 78610			
CONTACT PERSON		DAVID BEVIACQUA				CHRISTINA JOHNSON				SAMANTHA WILSON				VALERA BYRD			
TELEPHONE NO.		800-633-6845				281-448-7711				740-998-5363				512-437-6499			
FAX NUMBER																	
EMAIL		VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				SALES@OSBURNS.COM				samantha@lightleenterprises.com				vbyrd@roadsafetraffic.com			
DESCRIPTION	TX MUTCD #	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+
36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD	CW20-1D	Safety Zone		\$25.46	\$25.21	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
36" X 36" WORKERS AHEAD	CS21-1bT	Safety Zone		\$25.46	\$25.21	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH		Safety Zone		\$33.97	\$33.63	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD		Safety Zone		\$25.46	\$25.21	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL		Safety Zone		\$25.46	\$25.21	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
36" X 36" ONE LANE AHEAD		Safety Zone		\$25.46	\$25.21	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN		Safety Zone		\$33.97	\$33.63	JBC or Plasticade		\$92.00	\$88.00	Dicke	RUR36-200	\$88.80	\$86.20	Bone		\$59.50	\$58.50
48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD	W20-1D	Safety Zone		\$33.97	\$33.63	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$133.00	\$129.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$94.00
48" X 48" WORKERS AHEAD	CW21-1aT CW21-1bT	Safety Zone		\$33.76	\$33.42	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$133.00	\$129.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH		Safety Zone		\$38.50	\$38.14	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$133.00	\$129.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD	CW20-7 CW20-7aD	Safety Zone		\$33.76	\$33.42	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$133.00	\$129.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL	CW8-7	Safety Zone		\$33.97	\$33.63	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$133.00	\$129.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
48" X 48" MERGE (with Velcro-Interchangeable Left or Right)	CW8-2TL(R)	Safety Zone		\$50.28	\$49.78	JBC or Plasticade		\$141.00	\$137.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$168.00	\$164.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
48" X 48" ONE LANE AHEAD		Safety Zone		\$33.97	\$33.63	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$133.00	\$129.00	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN		Safety Zone		\$38.50	\$38.12	JBC or Plasticade		\$118.00	\$114.00	Dicke	RUR48-200	\$205.70	\$199.50	Bone		\$95.00	\$95.00
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:		30-45				30				30				7-14			

ITB #25-04 Road Saftey Products Signs and Post - Roll Up Sign Stand

BIDDERS NAME		VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC				ROADSAFE TRAFFIC LLC			
ADDRESS		408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536				3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086				22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628				601 COMMERCIAL DR. BUDA, TX 78610			
CONTACT PERSON		DAVID BEVIACQUA				CHRISTINA JOHNSON				SAMANTHA WILSON				VALERA BYRD			
TELEPHONE NO.		800-633-6845				281-448-7711				740-998-5363				512-437-6499			
FAX NUMBER																	
EMAIL		VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				SALES@OSBURNS.COM				samantha@lightleenterprises.com				vbyrd@roadsafetraffic.com			
DESCRIPTION	COMM CODE	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+
36" X 36" RIBS FOR SIGN	801-60	Safety Zone		\$14.50	\$14.50	JBC or Plasticade		\$13.50	\$12.25	Dicke	RR200-36	\$10.27	\$9.76	Bone		\$13.50	\$13.00
48" X 48" STAND	801-60	Safety Zone		\$185.00	\$185.00	JBC or Plasticade		\$98.50	\$96.50	Dicke	DL1008-RUB	\$152.60	\$146.50	Bone/Watchdog		\$140.00	\$135.00
48" X 48" RIBS FOR SIGN	801-60	Safety Zone		\$14.50	\$14.50	JBC or Plasticade		\$16.85	\$15.75	Dicke	RR200-48	\$12.70	\$12.08	Bone		\$16.50	\$16.00
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:		30-45				30											

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Rumble Strips

BIDDERS NAME			TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.			
ADDRESS			3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086			
CONTACT PERSON			CHRISTINA JOHNSON			
TELEPHONE NO.			281-448-7711			
FAX NUMBER						
EMAIL			SALES@OSBURNS.COM			
RUMBLE STRIPS	COMM CODE	COLOR	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-25	25+
RUMBLE STRIPS	550-79	WHITE	Swarco	4423 White	\$310.00	\$295.00
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:			30			
ALTERNATE LENGTH ROLL:			36 LF			

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Sign Caps and Cross Blades

BIDDERS NAME		VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS						TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.						LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC						ROADSAFE TRAFFIC LLC						XCESSORIES SQUARED DEVELOPMENT & MFG., INC.					
ADDRESS		408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536						3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77096						22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628						601 COMMERCIAL DR. BUDA, TX 78810						7350 W. STATE ROUTE 104 AUBURN, IL 62615					
CONTACT PERSON		DAVID BEVIACQUA						CHRISTINA JOHNSON						SAMANTHA WILSON						VALERA BYRD						ANDREW REINERT					
TELEPHONE NO.		800-633-6845						281-448-7711						740-998-5363						512-437-6499						888-987-3535					
FAX NUMBER																															
EMAIL		VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM						SALES@ROSSBURNS.COM						samantha@lightleenterprises.com						vbyrd@roadsafetyllc.com						areinert@x-sqrd.com					
SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES	COMM CODE	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10+	PER PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10+	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10+	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10+	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX	MFG #	PRICE 1-9	PRICE 10+	PRICE PER BOX	QTY IN BOX	ALTERNATE QTY IN BOX
SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT	801-12		\$2.95	\$2.92	\$295.00	100		MD Solutions	\$5.75	\$5.75	\$287.50	50		Dyna	\$12.20	\$11.10	\$212.00	20		MD	\$13.50	\$13.50	\$337.50	25		RPB922F	\$6.64	\$6.20	\$310.00	50	varies based on order
SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET, 2-3/8" Z238	801-12		\$4.95	\$4.95	\$247.50	50		MD Solutions	\$4.35	\$4.35	\$217.50	50		Dyna	\$3.98	\$3.80	\$165.00	50		GripTite	\$5.15	\$5.00	\$250.00	50		RPB2238	\$5.80	\$3.05	\$152.50	50	varies based on order
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE FLAT	801-12		\$12.15	\$12.03	\$303.75	25		MD Solutions	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$250.00	50		Dyna	\$10.75	\$9.95	\$192.20	20		MD	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$350.00	25		RPB91UFOL90	\$4.65	\$4.35	\$217.50	50	varies based on order
SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, FLAT	801-12		\$12.15	\$12.03	\$303.75	25		MD Solutions	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$250.00	50		Dyna	\$10.75	\$9.95	\$192.20	20		MD	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$350.00	25		RPB91UFNU180	\$4.65	\$4.35	\$217.50	50	varies based on order
SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT	801-12		\$12.15	\$12.03	\$303.75	25		MD Solutions	\$5.75	\$5.75	\$287.50	50		dyna	\$13.50	\$12.75	\$247.00	20		MD	\$13.50	\$13.50	\$337.50	25		RPB90F	\$5.10	\$5.40	\$262.00	50	varies based on order
BRACKET, Z238 ALUMINUM INTER LOCK	8010-12		\$0.40	\$0.40	\$20.00	40		MD Solutions	\$4.35	\$4.35	\$217.50	50		Dyna	\$4.20	\$4.00	\$192.50	50		MD	\$5.15	\$5.00	\$250.00	50		RPB922F1	\$3.50	\$3.25	\$162.50	50	varies based on order
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:		30-45												30						10-14						7-14					

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Sign Posts

BIDDER NAME				VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC				NEWMAN SIGNS INC.				ROADSAFE TRAFFIC LLC				XCESIGNS SQUARED DEVELOPMENT & MFG., INC.									
ADDRESS				408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36538 DAVID DELVACQUA 800-633-6845				3310 FROCK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086 CHRISTINA JOHNSON 281-448-7711				22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628 SAMANTHA WILSON 740-568-5363				1606 6TH AVE S W JAMESTOWN, ND 58401 DANI PAUL 800-437-8770				801 COMMERCIAL DR BUDA, TX 78610 VALERIA BYRGO 512-437-6499				7360 W. STATE ROUTE 104 AUBURN, IL 62615 ANDREW HENBERT 888-987-3635									
CONTACT PERSON																																	
TELEPHONE NO																																	
FAX NUMBER																																	
EMAIL				VULCAN@VULCANINC.COM				SALES@COSTRURNS.COM				samantha@lightleenterprises.com				dani@newmansigns.com				vsd@roadsafetraffic.com				info@xcesigns.com									
GALVANIZED	COMM CODE	LENGTH	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	
GALVANIZED, ROUND, 18 GA	801-30	12"	Valtr		\$35.05	\$1,296.85	37	No	Trinity		\$23.50				Valtr	238X 18 GA	\$41.00	\$1,391.20	37		VALTR		\$33.68	\$1,249.16			Alkore		\$82.00	\$3,034.00	37		
U-CHANNEL	COMM CODE	LENGTH	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	
U-CHANNEL, 2 L.B., GALVANIZED	801-30	10"	Valtr		\$27.61	\$1,375.90	50	No	Franklin		\$30.00				Franklin	2# Galv	\$37.90	\$1,800.00	50		CHICAGO HEIGHTS		\$24.42	\$1,321.00			Franklin Industries		UC2GLV10	\$27.10	\$1,355.00	50	N/A
U-CHANNEL, 2 L.B., GALVANIZED	801-30	12"	Valtr		\$33.01	\$1,650.50	50	No	Franklin		\$34.50				Franklin	2# Galv	\$45.48	\$2,180.00	50		CHICAGO HEIGHTS		\$31.07	\$1,553.50			Chicago Heights		\$40.00	\$2,000.00	50	N/A	
SOCKETS & WEDGES	COMM CODE	LENGTH	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	MFG NAME	MFG #	PRICE PER POST	PRICE PER BUNDLE	SIZE OF BUNDLE	ALTERNATE SIZE OF BUNDLE	
POZ-LOC SOCKETS	801-30		Valtr		\$26.36	\$1,318.00	50	No	Trinity		\$19.75				Valtr	720745G	\$26.00	\$814.75	37		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Alkore		\$24.00	\$888.00	37		
WEDGES FOR POZ-LOC SOCKETS	801-30		Valtr		\$4.78	\$239.00	50	No	Trinity		\$5.85				Valtr	720750G	\$4.00	\$129.50	37		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Alkore		\$8.00	\$296.00	37		
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO					30-45				30				30-60				30								round posts, sockets & wedges = 14-21 days / u-channel = 60-90 days								

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Slow Moving Vehicle

BIDDERS NAME			VULCAN INC. DBA VULCAN SIGNS				TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.				NEWMAN SIGNS INC.			
ADDRESS			408 EAST BERRY AVENUE FOLEY, AL 36536				3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086				1606 6TH AVE S W JAMESTOWN, ND 58401			
CONTACT PERSON			DAVID BEVIACQUA				CHRISTINA JOHNSON				DANI PAUL			
TELEPHONE NO.			800-633-6845				281-448-7711				800-437-9770			
FAX NUMBER														
EMAIL			VULCAN3@VULCANINC.COM				SALES@OSBURNS.COM				dpaul@newmansigns.com			
SLOW MOVING VEHICLE	COMM CODE	COLOR	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	1-9	10+
SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16"X 14"	801-83	RED/ ORANGE			\$16.50	\$16.50	Trantex		\$38.65	\$37.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SIGN ONLY, 16"X14"	8010-83	RED / ORANGE			\$16.50	\$16.50	Trantex		\$25.75	\$24.85			\$23.39	
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:			30-45				30				11-21			

ITB #25-04 Road Safety Products Signs and Post - Temporary and End of Road

BIDDERS NAME	TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.						LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC						NEWMAN SIGNS INC.						ROADSAFE TRAFFIC LLC					
ADDRESS	3310 FRICK RD HOUSTON, TX 77086						22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST. FRANKFORT, OH 45628						1606 6TH AVE S W JAMESTOWN, ND 58401						601 COMMERCIAL DR. BUDA, TX 78610					
CONTACT PERSON	CHRISTINA JOHNSON						SAMANTHA WILSON						DANI PAUL						VALERA BYRD					
TELEPHONE NO.	281-448-7711						740-998-5363						800-437-9770						512-437-6499					
FAX NUMBER																								
EMAIL	SALES@OSBURNS.COM						samantha@lightleenterprises.com						dpaul@newmansigns.com						vbyrd@roadsafetraffic.com					
TEMPORARY AND END OF ROAD	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10+	MFG NAME	MFG #	UOM	PKG	1-9	10+
TEMPORARY MARKER, POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: YELLOW #932-2Y	Pexco	932-2Y	EA		\$0.52	\$0.51	Apex Traffic	2WY	Box	500	\$340.00	\$340.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pexco		Box	500	\$0.73	\$0.72
TEMPORARY MARKER, POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: WHITE #932-2W	Pexco	932-2W	EA		\$0.52	\$0.51	Apex Traffic	2WW	Box	500	\$340.00	\$340.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pexco		Box	500	\$0.73	\$0.72
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:	21						30						No Bid											
END OF ROAD MARKER																								
RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18	Trantex				\$49.50	\$47.50	LEO	OM4-1			\$23.50	\$22.50	NEWMAN	OM4-1R18			26.67		Grimco				\$40.00	\$39.50
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:	30						30-45						11-21											